
DMTD WATKINS GLEN EVENT INFORMATION AUGUST 30-31, 2023  

 

ALL INFORMATION SUBJECT TO CHANGE WITHOUT NOTICE 

 

***PLEASE SHARE THIS INFORMATION WITH ALL DRIVERS, CREW 
MEMBERS, TRUCK DRIVERS AND TEAM MANAGERS*** 

 

LOAD IN PARKING:  Tuesday, August 29, specific time to follow. 

PADDOCK ACCESS/GARAGES:  The paddock will be open to DMTD participants on Tuesday, 
August 29.  Garage assignments will be attached.  There is no overnight camping and the facility will 
be closed at 10:00pm each night. If you are towing to the event and have an assigned garage, please 
park directly in front of your assigned garage bay. Do not obstruct fire lanes. If you do not have an 
assigned garage, please park anywhere in the South Paddock. 
  
DMTD EVENT REGISTRATION:  Will be held in the Great Room of the Media Center on Wednesday 
morning from 7:00am and will close promptly at 7:55am.  You will be required to sign our Release 
and Waiver of Liability Agreement and will then be issued a wristband and event windshield sticker.   
  
DRIVER MEETING: There will be a MANDATORY DRIVER MEETING in the Great Room at 8:00am 
on Wednesday. 
  
GARAGE AREA PROTOCOL:  No fueling, or storage of fuel, is permitted in the garages.  Direction 
of travel around the garage is counter-clockwise only.  This applies to all vehicles including pit bikes, 
tugs, street cars, etc. There is no smoking in the garages. 
  
HOURS:  The track will be hot from 8:30am until 4:30pm each day with a break for lunch from 
12:00pm until 1:00pm. 
  
PASSING:  Is permitted anywhere on the race track.  PASSING PERMISSION (“POINT BY”) IS 
MANDATORY IN CORNERS and, though strongly encouraged, is optional on straights. 
 
  
TIRE SERVICE/RETAIL/ON-SITE SHOP:  THE LITTLE SPEED 
SHOP (www.thelittlespeedshop.com) is a full service race facility located at the south end of the 
garages at WGI.  Contact Kevin Vanvalkenburgh at (585)205-8090 or stop by the shop during our 
event.  
  
FUEL: Self-service fuel (both leaded and unleaded) is available at the fuel island for purchase by credit card 

only each day from 8:30am until 3:30pm. 

 Link to order fuel delivered to track is on our website home page under “Track Days” menu. 

  
NUMBERS:  Are mandatory for all vehicles on the race track.  Numbers must be at least 10” high on 
each side of the vehicle and 6” high on a vertical surface at the rear of the vehicle.  You will not be 
allowed access to the race track without a conforming set of numbers. 
  
TRACK DAMAGE:  Drivers are financially responsible for any damage that they cause to race track 
property including, but not limited to, tire bundles, guard rails and posts.  Additionally, any absorbent 
material used to clean up after fluid spills, leaks, etc. and/or any fire suppression used on your behalf 

http://www.thelittlespeedshop.com/


will be billed back to the driver of the car.  WGI has informed us that, if a comprehensive cleanup is 
necessary due to a significant fluid spill, the charge will be $500 per hour. 

 


